
Faculty Positions in Psychology at The University of Texas at Dallas 

The School of Behavioral and Brain Sciences at The University of Texas at Dallas 
(UTD) invites applications for 3 tenure-stream positions at the Assistant, Associate, or 
Full Professor ranks in our highly successful programs in Psychology and Cognitive 
Neuroscience at the University of Texas at Dallas. Successful candidates will join 
existing research strengths in child development, aging, perception, learning and 
memory, reasoning, and social/personality psychology, including an exceptionally 
strong group in cognitive brain imaging. The University offers competitive salaries and 
generous start-up packages. 

We seek to hire 3 tenure stream faculty members during this academic year, and 
applicants from all areas of Psychology will be considered. Priority will be given to 
exceptional candidates with a research focus in the following areas: (1) social/affective 
neuroscience, using human neuroimaging techniques to advance understanding of 
human social or affective processes, especially in the area of prejudice and intergroup 
relations; (2) cognitive development and/or developmental cognitive neuroscience, 
employing innovative methods in experimental psychology and/or human neuroscience 
to study children; (3) developmental psychopathology, using sophisticated research 
techniques to address issues relevant to mental health, particularly in adolescence. 

The successful candidate will build an independent research program and collaborate 
with colleagues throughout the School of Behavioral and Brain Sciences, including the 
programs in Neurobiology and Speech, Language, and Hearing Sciences, as well as 
the research centers (e.g., Center for Children and Families, Center for Vital Longevity, 
Center for Brain Health, Center for Advanced Pain Studies). The new hire will be 
expected to teach graduate and undergraduate courses within their area of expertise.   

Applicants should hold a PhD in Psychology, Cognitive Neuroscience, or related field 
and show evidence of a dynamic and productive research program with clear potential 
for funding. Applicants should send electronic copies of a curriculum vitae, a statement 
of current and future research, and a statement of teaching philosophy and experience. 
Applicants should also arrange for the submission of three letters of recommendation. 
All materials may be submitted online (http://jobs.utdallas.edu/postings/13175).  	

UTD is a Tier One Institution and the fastest growing university in Texas. It houses a 
dynamic and collaborative research community in psychology, neurobiology, and 
speech, language, and hearing sciences. Faculty in the School of Behavioral and Brain 
Sciences are based both on the main campus and at three research centers located in 
central Dallas near the University of Texas Southwestern Medical Center (UTSW), with 
which there are strong collaborative relationships. Excellent laboratories and core 



facilities are present both on the main campus and at the research centers. Of particular 
relevance are our two affiliated human imaging centers. UTSW houses the Advanced 
Imaging Research Center (AIRC), an inter-institutional facility that provides 
neuroimaging resources supporting the research of UTD faculty. The AIRC houses both 
3T and 7T research MRI scanners, in addition to PET and MEG. The UTD Center for 
Brain Health, which houses a number of Behavioral and Brain Sciences faculty 
members, will open in Fall 2019 a new UTD Imaging Center, with two state-of-the-art 
research 3T MRI Scanners. 

The Dallas-Fort Worth area is an international hub with a strong economy, vibrant 
cultural atmosphere, world-class sports and entertainment, and nationally ranked public 
schools. 

The University of Texas at Dallas is an Equal Opportunity / Affirmative Action employer. 
All qualified applicants will receive consideration for employment without regard to race, 
color, religion, sex, national origin, disability, age, citizenship status, Vietnam era or 
special disabled veteran’s status, or sexual orientation. Indication of gender and ethnic 
origin for affirmative action purposes is requested as part of the application process but 
is not required for consideration.  


